B21-17, Computer Equipment Tabsheet Virtucom SCW Lepopo Corp B&H Photo Howard Technology Connection ICT Resources IOT Professional PSSHS Ananke IT Solutions Mosaic Technology Simply NUC
Line Item EStlcTt?/ted Manufacturer Model # Description Unit Cost Extended Cost Lead Time Unit Cost Extended Cost Lead Time Unit Cost Extended Cost Lead Time Unit Cost Extended Cost Lead Time Unit Cost Extended Cost Lead Time Unit Cost Extended Cost Lead Time Unit Cost Extended Cost Lead Time Unit Cost Extended Cost Lead Time Unit Cost Extended Cost Lead Time Unit Cost Extended Cost Lead Time Unit Cost Extended Cost Lead Time Unit Cost Extended Cost Lead Time
4 300 C2G 56781 1 FT 4K HDMI Cable With Ethernet $4.59 $1,377.00 3 Weeks $4.12 $1,236.00 3-5 Days $5.68 $1,704.00 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $1,500.00 3-7 Days $3.96 $1,188.00 14 Days $3.74 $1,122.00 In Stock $5.08 $1,524.00 5 days $7.99 $2,397.00 30 Days $4.26 $1,278.00 2 Weeks $4.71 $1,413.00 7 Days $9.00 $2,700.00 60-90 Days
Acer Chromebox CXI3 Mini PC 4 GB 1.8 . . . . . )
9 790 Acer DT.Z17AA.002 GHZ $168.00 $132,720.00 7-10 Days $202.93 $160,314.70 3-5 Days $479.99 $379,192.10 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid $217.00 $171,430.00 3-7 Days $164.47 $129,931.30 7 Days $171.09 $135,161.10 In Stock $205.56 $162,392.40 15 days $236.99 $187,222.10 30 Days $203.35 $160,646.50 2 Weeks $175.00 $138,250.00 7 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid
Acer KA240Y LED Monitor Full HD . . .
10 1090 Acer UM.QX0AA.005 1080P 23.8" $123.50 $134,615.00 8 Weeks $132.67 $144,610.30 3-5 Days $131.97 $143,847.30 N/A $129.99 $141,689.10 3-7 Days $141.00 $153,690.00 3-7 Days $117.36 $127,922.40 45 Days $123.14 $134,222.60 2-6 Weeks $123.09 $134,168.10 60 days $160.99 $175,479.10 30 Days $124.14 $135,312.60 2 Weeks $133.00 $144,970.00 3-4 Weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid
The following items from bid B21-17 have been non-awarded at this time.
1 300 Intel NUC NUC7PJYH Desktop Comput_er Mini PC Pentium
Silver
) 300 Western Digital WDS500G2B0A 560GB Solid State Drive Internal 2.5
SATA 6GB
3 300 Edge Memory PE253233 8 GB DDR4 SDRAM Memory Module
5 118 Intel NUCSIZHNK Mini PC Computing Kit Core i7 8705G
3.1GH
6 236 Crucial CT8G4SFS824A 8 GB SO-DIMM DDR4 2400 SDRAM
7 118 Western Digital WDS500G2B0B >00GB Solid Statzz:"e Internal SATA
8 320 Viewsonic VA2446MH-LED 24" 1080P Monitor with HDMI & VGA




